
 IFB-23007-2 OIL GREASE
DECEMBER 13,2023 THRU DECEMBER 12, 2024

IFB-23007-2 OIL AND GREASE
EFFECTIVE JANUARY 23, 2024 CERTIFIED TRI-CON SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS

LABORATORIES INC INC
DESCRIPTION
1 NO BID $8.99 NO BID
Anti-freeze, in gallon container (6ea 1gal/case) GALLON
No pre-Ready, Must be straight Anti Freeze 6/1 GL CS
Autoguard, NO SUBSTITUTIONS BRAND: MARCUS

MAKE: ALL TEMP
2
Grease, multi-purpose, red high temp. in tubes $266.95/ 48 TB/CS $101.08/ 24TB /CS $51.00/CS

48 TUBES/CS $4.21 TUBE N/A 48 TB/CS
(10-14 oz tubes/case), Royal 876 Grease PACKAGING: CASE OF 48X 14 TUBES PACKAGING: 24/1 CASE PACKAING: 10/1 CASE
NO SUBSTITUTIONS BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: TOTAL BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS

MODEL: LITHIPLEX # 12020286  MAKE: MULTIS COMPLEX EP#2  MAKE:  
3
K-1 Kerosene, in drum (55 gals/drum) NO BID $6.49 NO BID

GALLON
BRAND: SUPER S

Valero. Sub must be approved by Orange County MAKE: K1 KEROSENE
4
HD Engine Oil, single weight – 30, NO BID $5.5600 NO BID
Quart containers – (12 qts/cs.) QUART
API-SJ; CI4-30, Royal D/S Supreme 30, 12/1 QT CS
Sub must be approved by Orange County BRAND: TOTAL

MAKE: RUBIA S 30
5
HD Engine Oil, API C14-15W/40 NO BID $18.18 $10.18
Drum containers (55 gals/drum) GALLON GALLON
Rottela 2 1540, BRAND: SHELL BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
NO SUBTITUTION MAKE: ROTELLA T4 15W40  MAKE: 3102253 
6
Hydraulic Oil, EP; A W -5k, Drum containers $15.40 $15.45/GL N/A / GAL
(55 gals/drum) GALLON GALLON $490.00/ 55 DRUM
Royal, Rozer 68, $847.00/55G DRUM $849.75 /55 DRUM
Sub must be approved by Orange County BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: TOTAL BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS

MAKE: HOC EXTREME ISO 68 #12063754 MAKE: AZOLLA ZS 68  MAKE: 3101481 
7 NO BID $4.84 $4.25
Automatic Transmission Fluid QUART QUART
Quart containers – (12 qts/cs.) 12/1 QT CS 12/1 QT CS
Mercon/Dexron III BRAND: TOTAL
Royal Multi Tran ATF MAKE: FLUID DILL MV BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
Sub must be approved by Orange County  MAKE: 3101872 
8  
Transmission & Drive Train Oil, $1,171.50/ $1,101.10 $675.00
T04-30, in drum (55 gals/drum) 55 G DRUM 55 G DRUM 55 G DRUM
Royal Tran & Drive Train 30  BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: TOTAL BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
NO SUBSTITUTIONS #10043641 MAKE: DYNATRANS AC 30W  MAKE: 3102425 
9
DES, Diesel Exhaust Fluid, 2-1/2 Gallon, NO BID $9.25 NO BID
Sub must be approved by Orange County 2.5 GALLON

BRAND: NOXGUARD
MAKE: NOXGUARD

10
HD Engine Oil, multivicosity – 5W20, NO BID $5.25 $2.79
Sub must be approved by Orange County QUART 12 QUART CASE

BRAND: TOTAL BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
MAKE: QUARTZ 7000 5W20  MAKE: 3103296 

11
TRANSYND TES 295 $215.25/ 5GL PAIL N/A / GAL

SYSTHETIC FLUID
 ALSO IN 55 GL DRUM #12060056 

$37.85/GL NO BID $100.00/ 5GL PAIL
BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS

sub must be approved by Orange County  MAKE: TORQUE GLIDE #12060055  MAKE: 3102411 
12
BLUE DEF DIESEL $13.34/ GL NO BID $14.00/ GL
EXHAUST FLUID $26.68/ 2.5 GL #12081397 PACKAGING: 2.5 GAL
NO SUBSTITUTIONS  $6.90/ GL/ 55 GL DRUM #12080944 BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS

 $5.25/ GL 330 GL TOTE TANK #12080945  MAKE: 320025 

 $1739.00/ PALLET 80X2.5 GL #12068614 
 BRAND: KLEEN-DEF (PEAK) 

MAKE: #12081397
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IFB-23007-2 OIL AND GREASE
CERTIFIED TRI-CON SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS

LABORATORIES INC INC
13
80W-90 MASTERPRO NO BID $5.72 NO BID
GEAR OIL QUART

BRAND: TOTAL
sub must be approved by Orange County MAKE: TRANSMISSION MDL 80W90
14
CONOCO 68 A W $847.00 NO BID $467.50
TO BE PUMPED BY VENDOR IN ORANGE DRUM DRUM
COUNTY TANK BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
NO SUBSTITUTIONS MAKE: HOC XTREME ISO 68  MAKE: 3100032 
15
ROTELLA 15 W-40 $1,204.50 NO BID $563.75
TO BE PUMPED BY VENDOR IN ORANGE DRUM DRUM

BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS

NO SUBSTITUTIONS
MAKE: SPECTRA XTREME 15W40 CK4 

#12071119  MAKE: 3102134 
16
DEX-COOL 50/50 PREDILUTED NO BID $47.97 NO BID
EXTENDED LIFE ANTI-FREEZE/COOLANT. case

BRAND: MARCUS
sub must be approved by Orange County MAKE: THERMOGUARD
17
SUPER S HIGH TEMP $266.95 NO BID $46.25/ CASE
GREASE, 14OZ, CARTRIDGE, 12/CASE, CASE 48 /cartridges PACKAGING: 10 TUBE CASE

BRAND: CERTIFIED LABS BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
sub must be approved by Orange County MAKE: LITHIPLEX #12020286  MAKE: 3102212 
18
DURAMAX DEXTRON/MERCON 3 NO BID NO BID $37.00/CASE
TRANSMISSION FLUID, 6QT/CASE, 1 QT CASE
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
 MAKE: 3101087 

19
DEX-COLL 50/50 PREDILUTED NO BID $9.3625/DRUM $330.00/DRUM
EXTENDED LIFE ANTI-FREEZE/COOLANT, BRAND: MARCUS 55 GAL DRUM
55 GALLON DRUM, BRAND: NAPA MAKE: THERMOGUARD BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
sub must be approved by Orange County  MAKE: 640055 
20
SCHAFFER SAE 5W-20, OIL, SUPREME NO BID $1,227.88/DRUM $595.00
FULL SYNTHETIC FDEXOS 1 GEN 2 BRAND: TOTAL DRUM
COMPLINAT ENGINE OIL, FORMULATED MAKE: QUARTZ 9000 FUTURE 5W20 BRAND: PERFORMACE PLUS
WITH MICRON MOLY AND PENTRO TO  MAKE: 3103402 
EXTEND ENGINE LIFE & DRAIN
CAPABILITY & IMPROVE FUEL ECONOMY
sub must be approved by Orange County
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